


CITY OF NOVI - T-SHIRTS SPORTS APPAREL BID TAB BID DUE 8/13/13

Latal
Ashgrove Impressive American Home Team Riddell/All
ltem |Description Express Press All American Marketing P tional Silk Athletic Classic Wear American
SETUP/ARTWORK . 4 . \ : ’ ? S T

1 [Logo Setup/Artwork Dept/City
2 |Logo Setup/Artwork Sponsor
PRINTING COSTS
Numerals (1-2 per location)
1 color logo/1 location
2 color logo/1 location
1 color logo/2 location
2 color logo/2 location
"Coach", "Supervisor", “Staff"
EMBROIDERY COSTS
9 |Embroidered logo (each)
FLAG FOOTBALL

no charge
charge

W|IN|® o]~ |w

10 |Mesh Football Jersey Augusta 9500 Augusta 8500/9501 Augusta 240/241 Augusta 240/241 ProDown 1416760 Augusta 283 A4-NA139/NB4139 | Augusta 257A, 258A | Riddell 1366/1376
Youth Small-Youth XL 8.88 9.99 10.37 10.95 9.00 11.74 9.45 12.95 12.89
Adult Small - Adult XL 10.24 9.99 11.68 11.95 9.00 12.42 10.80 13.95 13.89
Adult 2XL 11.50 9.00 10.80 13.89
Adult 3XL 12.50 9.00 12.80 89
BASKETBALL \ ‘ . ‘ L -
11 JReversible Tank Jersey - poly Augusta 197 Augusta 136/137 Augusta 136/137 Augusta 197/198 Alleson 560RY Augusta 136 A4-NF1270/N2206 fport Tek ST500,STY50 Riddell PKR/PKRY
Youth Small-Youth XL 8.70 8.256 8.97 9.50 7.00 9.20 6.76 7.95 4.69
Adult Small - Adult XL 9.40 9.25 10.40 10.50 7.50 10.34 6.75 9.25 4.69
Adult 2XL 10.50 10.49 11.70 11.50 7.50 11.24 7.10 10.25 4.69
Adult 3XL 11.50 11.99 13.06 12.50 7.50 12.35 8.60 12.25 4.69
VOLLEYBALL - . L . o . L 1 .
12 |Volleyball shirt - poly Augusta 1230 Augusta 12301231 Augusta 1230-1231 | Augusta 1230/1231 |Badger 4163 Vneck tee Augusta 1230 Augusta 1230/1231 | Augusta 1230/1231 Riddell 1763/1743
Youth Med-Youth XL 875 8.69 9.54 10.50 7.50 11.46 9.59 1175 17.79
Adult Small - Adult XL 9.95 9.99 10.74 11.50 7.50 12.34 13.42 12.70 19.07
Adult 2XL 11.25 0.34 12.18 12.50 7.50 12.84 16.13 14.00 19.07
Adult 3XL 12.25 N/A N/A N/A 7.50 N/A N/A NIA 19.07
BASEBALL -

13 |Complete Uniform Package

Augsta 580/581, Augusta 580/581, ‘Augusta 580/587,
Augusta 643 Sportek YT201, T210 Augusta 804/808 August 804/808 | Alleson 552pc, LLBDK2 August BOB/S04
Youth Small -Youth XL 27 .10 20.49 20.38 * 23.95 20.00 25.67 22.20 52.95 no bid

Adult Small - Adult XL 31.78 24.99 25.28* 27.95 22.00 55.95

FASTPITCH SOFTBALL (LADIES)
14 {Complete Uniform Package

Augusta 577/578, Augsta 577/578, ‘Augusta 577/578, ‘ ~Augusta 136071357,
Augusta 577, 935 Champro SS6, SS6Y Augusta 935/936 August 935/936 Augusta 577/935 August 1292/1293
Youth Small-Youth XL 22.34 23.55 2145~ 24.95 26.00 42.95 no bid
Adult Small - Adult XL 23.96 24.75 23.25~ 25.95 28.00 45.95 no bid
ADULT SOFTBALL/ICOACH/THEATRE/STAFF ‘ .

15 {T-Shirts, SS, 50/50 cotton/poly Gildan 8000 Port & Co PC55/PC55Y Gildan G8000 Jerzees 29M Gildan G800 Gildan GBOO Gildan Jerzzee 20M/29B Riddell RTSF

Youth Smaill - Youth XL 2.98 269 2.89 3.25 3.50 3.80 3.10 5.95 no bid
Adult Small - Adult XL 2.86 2.69 3.48 3.25 3.50 3.80 3.25 6.65 379
Adult 2X1 477 4.99 5.57 5.50 3.50 5.80 3.80 7.65 6.79

Adult 3XL 4.77 4.99 5.65 5.50 6.00 6.50 3.95 8.65 no bid

Adult 4XL 477 4.99 5.72 5.50 6.50 7.00 3.95 9.65 no bid

16 | T-shirts, SS, Moisture Wicking Gildan 42000 Augusta 790 Augusta 796 Jerzees 21M Badéer }1120 Augusta 790

SportTek ST350 Riddell RTPM
Adult Small - Adult XL 6.75
Adult 2XL 8.25
Adult 3XL 9.25

Adult 4XL -
17 |T-shirts, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly Gildan 8400 Port & Co PC55LS Port & Co. PC55PLS Jerzees 29L Gildan G840 Gildan 8400 Gildan 8400 Riddell GD182
Adult Small - Adult XL 5.95 4.99 ) 5.76 6.50 7.25 8.49 6.53 6.69
Adult 2X1 7.25 6.49 7.38 7.50 9.00 8.49 8.08 8.69
Adult 3XL 7.25 6.49 7.57 8.50 10.00 9.49 8.08 no bid

7.95

18 |Polo Shirt, SS, 50/50 Gildan 8800 G8800 Port & Co. KP55 Hanes 054 Jerzees J300 Gildan 8800 Port & Co. KP55 no bid
Adult Small - Adult XL 4.42 5.50 5.99 6.50 6.50 6.63 9.25 no bid

Adult 2XL 6.42 7.99 7.18 8.50 8.50 9.24 10.25 no bid

Adult 3XL 6.42 8.49 8.39 8.50 10.00 924 11.25 no bid

13.00 9.24 12.25

9.59 8.50

6.42

Adult 4XL

Port JST72 Badger 7618 SportTek JST72 Riddell CRA9944

19 jWind Shirt, LS, Vneck Badger 7618 Port JST72 Port JST72 Harriton m720 Augusta lined 3415
Adult Small - Adult XL 17.97 12.25 12.48 14.95 23.00 15.37 19.88 16.75 23.00
Adult 2XL 20.97 12.99 13.73 15.85 25.00 16.37 19.88 18.75 24.00
Adult 3XL 2297 14.99 16.25 17.95 27.00 17.37 22.65 20.75 25.00
Adult 4XL 24.97 15.99 17.48 18.95 28.00 18.37 23.56 22.75 26.00
20 Polo Shirt, SS, wicking Jerzees 441MR Harriton M315 SportTek ST690, LST630) Harriton M315 Nike 476281/476325 Harriton M315 A4-N3168/NW3197 |SportTek ST650, LST650) Riddell BAXT48
Adult Small - Adult XL 10.97 12.25 11.18 13.95 23.00 15.37 12.07 16.95 8.59
Adult 2XL 14.97 12.99 12.59 14.95 23.00 16.37 12.07 17.95 8.59
Adult 3XL 27.00 8.59
Adult 4XL

27.00
21 |T-shirts, 88, Hanes 5170 -
Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL. 6.36
Adult 3XL 7.36
Adult 4XL

22 | T-shirts, SS, Hanes Cool Dri 4820
Adult Small - Adult X1

Adult 2X1 9.42 10.54 11.95 10.95
Adult 3XL 10.42 11.14 no bid
Adult 4XL |

23 |Polo Shirt - Holloway 222423 ‘
Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL 33.00 24.15 23.63 22.95 24.78
Adult 3XL 38.00 25.15 2565 24.95 25.78
Adult 4XL 26.78
24 | Sweatshirt - Gildan 18000 i b Riddell RCSS
Adult Small - Adult XL 10.00 8.35 8.44 9.95 11.59
Adult 2XL 12.00 10.35 10.52 11.25 14.59
Adult 3XL 14.00 11.35 10.52 12.25 no bid
Adult 4XL i
25 |Sweatshirt - FOL 82300 \
Adult Small - Adult XL
Adult 2XL . )
Adult 3XL 29.00 16.43 N/A 14.95 20.12
26 |Sweatshirt - Jerzees 4662M : sub Riddell 12365
Adult 4XL 20.00 12.64 14.47 N/A 17.63

| sk Riddeli HNR48
24.95
28.10
29.95
iddell EL377
27.95
30.95
31.59

27 |Hoodie - Hanes F170 .
Adult Small - Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL
28 |Zip Hoodie - FOL 82230R :
Adult Small - Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL

29 |Zip Hoodie - PC90ZH

Adult 4XL
30 |Parka - Ash City 88007 L

Adult Small - Adult XL 85.90 88.68 89.95 95.00 no bid
Adult 2XL 91.58 89.90 93.12 94.95 100.00 94.90 95.18 no bid
Adult 3XL 92.58 91.90 94.90 95.95 e 0 95.90 96.52 no bid
Delivery after receipt of order 14 days 10 business days 10 days 10 business 3 weeks J 10 business days 10-14 days 10-15 working days 30 days ARO
. o there is a mark on
Yes. Did not indicate
which addendums. Did No, but viewed sheet, not sure
Acknowledged Addendums (2) Yes not download from MITN them on MITN Two 182 No #1 only what it means 182
Included information sheets for
apparel quoted? Yes Yes Yes Yes No No No ves Yes, CD
Included info regarding ordering
& delivery process? Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes, not detailed

* Do not include shipping. Shipping cost approx. $0.825 each.



CITY OF NOVI - T-SHIRTS SPORTS APPAREL BID TAB

BID DUE 8/13/13

All American

Express

Express

Press Ashgrove Ashgrove tmpressive Impressive

American

American
Silkscreen

BSHN Sports

Home Team

Home Team

Classic

18 |Polo Shirt, SS, 50/50

Gildan 8800

Port & Co. KP55 Hanes 054

Gildan 8800

6.00

Jerzees J300

Gildan 8800

ltem |Description Qty P
SETUP/IARTWORK i .
2 [Logo Setup/Artwork Sponsor 5 | 0,00 "] nocharge |
PRINTING COSTS
3 Numerals (1-2 per location) 2790 0.65 1,813.50 1.00 2,790.00 1.05 2,929.50 1.00 2,790.00 0.90 2,511.00 3.50 9,765.00 2.00 5,580.00 3.00 8,370.00
4 1 color logo/1 location 1797 0.60 1,078.20 0.35 628.95 0.80 1,437.60 0.50 898.50 0.80 1,437:60 1.75 3,144:75 1.50 2,695.50 1.75 3,144.75
8 "Coach", "Supervisor", "Stafl" 120 0.50 0.00 0.50 60.00 0.50 60.00 0.50 60.00 0.50 60.00 4.00 480.00 1.50 180.00 3.00 360.00
EMBROIDERY COSTS
9 |Embroidered logo (each) 82
FLAG FOOTBALL
Augusta
10 |Mesh Football Jersey 9500/9501 Augusta 9500 Augusta 240/241 Augusta 240/241 Augusta 283 ProDown 1418760 A4-NA139/NB4139 Augusta 257A, 258A
Youth Small-Youth XL| 60 9.99 599.40 8.88 532.80 10.37 622.20 10.95 657.00 11.74 704.40 9.00 540.00 9.45 567.00 12.95 777.00
BASKETBALL
g port Te
11 |Reversible Tank Jersey - poly 136/137 Augusta 197 Augusta 136/137 Augusta 197/198 Augusta 136 Alleson 560RY A4-NF1270/N2206 S8T500,STY500
Adult Small - Adult XL| 450 9.25 4.162.50 9.40 4,230.00 10.40 4,680.00 10.50 4,725.00 10.34 4,653.00 7.50 3,375.00 6.75 3,037.50 9.25 4,162.50
VOLLEYBALL
Augusta
12 [Volleyball shirt - poly 1230/1231 Augusta 1230 Augusta 1230-1231 Augusta 1230/1231 Augusta 1230 Badger 4163 Vneck tee Augusta 1230/1231 Augusta 1230/1231
Adult Small - Adult XL| 125 9.99 1,248.75 9.95 1,243.75 10.74 11.50 12.34 7.50 13.42
BASEBALL
13 |Complete Uniform Package
Sportek YT201, Augsta 580/581, Augusta 580/581,
T210 Augusta 643 Augusta 804/808 * August 804/808 Alleson 552pc, LLBDK2 August 808/804
Adult Small - Adult XL} 220 22.00 55.95 12,308.00
FASTPITCH SOFTBALL {LADIES) .
14 |Complete Uniform Package
Augusta 577/578,
Champro SS8, Augusta 577, Augsta 577/578, Augusta 577/578, Augusta 1350/1357,
SS8Y 935 Augusta 935/936 * August 935/936 Augusta 577/935 August 1292/1293
Adult Smalt - Adult XLi 90 24.08 28
ADULT SOFTBALL/ICOACH/THEATREISTAFF
Port & Co
15 |T-Shirts, SS, 50/50 cotton/poly PC55/PC55Y Gildan G8000 Jerzees 29M Gildan G800 Gildan G800 Gildan Jerzzee 29M/29B
Adult Small - Adult XL} 195 524.55 557.70 678.60 633.75 741.00 3.50 682.50 3.25 633.75 6.65 1,296.75
Adult 2XL} 53 264 .47 252.81 295.21 291.50 307.40 3.50 185.50 7.65 405.45
Adult 3XL| 25 8.65 216.25

Port & Co. KP55

Adult Small - Adult XL

4.42

5.99

6.50

7.30

6.50

6.63

9.25

SportTek ST690,
20  |Polo Shirt, 88, wicking Harriton M315 Jerzees 441MR LST690 Harriton M315 Harriton M315 Nike 476281/476325 A4-N3168/NW3197 SportTek ST650, LST650
Aduli Small - Adult XL} 20 12.25 245.00 10.97 219.40 11.18 223.60 13.95 279.00 15.37 307.40 23.00 460.00 12.07 241.40 16.95 339.00

** did not submit bid on all items

23 |Polo Shirt - Holloway 222423 - ,
Adult Small - Adult XL| 33 1,089.00 . .
Adult2XL| 2 66.00 47.26 22.95 45.90
Adult 4XL| 5 200.00
24 |Sweatshirt - Gildan 18000
Adult Small - Adult XL| 2
Adult 2XL| 9
Adult 4XL| 1
25 |Sweatshirt - FOL 82300
Adult Small - Adult XL.| 19
Adult 2XL] 12
Adult 3XL| 7
26 |Sweatshirt - Jerzees 4662M
Adult4XL} 3
28 |Zip Hoodie - FOL 82230R
Adult Small - Adult XL} 21
Adult 2XLi 16
Adult 3XL{ 14
29 |Zip Hoodie - PC90ZH | . . .
Adultaxt| 5 - , » -
30 |Parka - Ash City 88007 . ! . ~ . . .. . . .
Adult Small - Adult XL| 4 85.90 343.60 89.58 358.32 83.68 354.72 89.95 359.80 89.90 359.60 95.00 380.00 93.83 375.32 0.00
Adult 2XL| 2 89.90 179.80 91.58 183.16 93.12 186.24 94.95 189.90 94.90 189.80 100.00 200.00 95.18 190.36 0.00
21,537.4¢ 23,362.89 24 .203.87 24 494 55 24,851.07 32,531.25 2591022 % 40532.60 **






Badger Hook Ladies' Jacket

Adult Small — Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL

VOLLEYBALL | Ladies only

§ 925
$ 10 A9GEA
$ 499 EA

Page 7 of 143

12. Sleeveless Volleyball shirt (loy-down collar, V-neck, moisture wicking polyester

mesh) ~
Brand & Style number M uguasle. 1230 /iz 30
Youth Med - Youth XI $ 369 EA
Adult Small - Adulf XL $ 9-99 Fa
Adult 2XL $ 1029 EA
Adult 3XL $_NNH EA
BASEBALL

13. Complete Uniform Package (2 button 50/50 cotton/poly henley, long white pants

with elastic waist, socks, cap)

Youth S —Youth XL
Adult Small = Adult XL

FASTPITCH SOFIBALL Ladies’ only

$ 204%EA
$ 2499 FA

14. Complete Uniform package (sleeveless polyester shiny "dazzle” jersey and shorts,

socks, visor)

Youth Small ~ Youth XL
Adult Small - Adult XL

ADULT SOFTBALL / COACH APPAREL / THEATRE / STAFF

15. Tees - short sleeve

(50-50 cotfton/poly)

Brand & Style number_ P55 /PC5SY (post 2 Conpoiyg)

Youth Small - Youth XL
Adult Small - Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL
Adult 4XL

http://web.herspw.com/cgi-bin/live/site.w?location=b2¢/product. w&product=BD7902&de...

Page 15 of 19

5/22/2013



16. Tees ~ short sleeve, Moisture Wicking (100% polyester)
Brand & Style number BrugusaXo. 7190

Page 16 of 19

Adult Small - Adult XL $ 599 Ea
Adult 2XL $ 115 EA
Adlult 3XL $ 849 A
Adult 4XL $ B9 EA
17. Tees ~ long sleeve (50-50 cotien/poly)
Brand & Style number /\)L 55 LS
Adult Small - Adult XL $ 499 kA
Adult 2XL $ 649 A
Aduif 3XL $ 647 EA
Adult 4XL $ 669 Ea
18. Polo Shirt — short sleeve (50/50 cotton/poly)
Brand & Style number G 8800
Adult Small = Adult XL $ S-S0EA
Adult 2XL $71-49 £A
Adult 3XL $ 349 £a
Adult 4XL $ .25 A
19. Wind Shirt, long sleeve, unlined, V-neck
Brand & Style number Peoat JLT T2
Adult Small = Adult XL $ VZ2-25EA
Adult 2XL $ 42 A9 EA
Adult 3XL $ 14 A9EA
Adult 4XL $ 1599 FA
20. Polo Shirt, shoit sleeve, wicking fabric, Men’'s & Ladies’
Brand & Style numbers  FloAaAy Len ™M 215
Adult Small = Adult XL $12-25EA



21

22

23.

24

25

Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL
Adult 4XL

. T-shirt, Short Sleeve - Hanes 50/50 Heavyweight #5170
Adult Small = Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL ¢
Adult 4XL
. T-shirf, Short Sleeve - Hanes Cool Dri #4820 (100% poly)
Adult Small — Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL.
Adult 4XL

Polo Shirt - Short Sleeve - Holloway #222423 Dry-Excel
Adult Small — Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL
Adult 4XL

. Crew Neck Sweatshirt - Gildan 18000

Adult Small — Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL
Adult 4XL

. Crew Neck Sweatshirt = Fruit of the Loom #82300

Adult Small — Adult XL
Adult 2XL
Adult 3XL

Page 17 of 19

$ 42 99 Ea
$ 1A A9 EA
$15:99 EA

$219 ga
$525FA
$5‘25EA

$ 2199 €A
$ 23:99€A

$ _L1"25EA
$12°99 £A
$ 1475 EA



26. Crew Neck Swealshiit - jerzees #44662M
Adult 4XL $ 12 99EA
27. Hoodie Pullover Sweatshirt ~ Hanes F170
Adult Small - Adult XL $16 49 Fa
Adult 2XL $ 2099 FA
Adult 3XL & $20:99€A
28. Full ZIip Hooded Sweatshirt — Fruit of the Lloom #82230R
Adult Small — Adult XL $18° 99 £a
Adult 2XL $ 2199 A
Adult 3XL $ 2149 EA
29. Full Zip Hooded Sweaishirt - Port & Company PCI0ZH
Adult 4XL $22-49€A
30. Parka - Ash City 88007 Men's 3-in-1 with Dobby Trim
Adult Small = Adult XL $NS 9D EA
AUt 2XL SR A0 EA
Adult 3XL $UA0EA

DELIVERY DATE: 10 DBudise gy ckads  days dfter receipt of order

Please be sure to include the description of your ordering/delivery process as indicated
in the Bid Submittals section of the specifications.

OERIVEP: Com b“ ,’}é“'”’(‘o e n‘/cu% Po # '
Sondecpaaeteyes com - e pneeal 10 beglooss
{‘M&/‘f coatcioak cpprivel . Once o aokes g plo—esal,
o PAiee: Lo o bler e W cn O\W/@—/\/\J’\,( o Gen
it Jeislomen e oodocosk [ Popes rwwz\ ERHERY:

moJﬁL NI Oté/é/w\—bvvi d A e & W asg }%ﬂ—%/u—dfi

Comments/Exceptions:
(e o=
olece
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We acknowledge the following addendums

¢ Ly AR™Y NA TonAL QuARD Lw/u/x deal%%uwg Eocl2.

‘/_5—13/4/ AL #Q»u«_%.

s

References: Please provide at least three (3) current references for which you provide a

similar scope of service:

Company CARLAN D CO@NTY

Address e Lomek SLQ»VUQZQ{ L 12 oo N %Jloud H 47 Mf m“j’”

Phone 24 3- B858- 04 Confact name

s joibph Dol

on‘lcxc
MT-483

Company _

C}l:,! D/]O LAavOoNTH ("97;22, ‘:Dé":?m{TMEs\ﬁ)

Address 14910 4+ ARwmIinGTon

Koad , MT -

A4 2154

Phone 7134~ £73-40770 Confact name

Miike

Rusms k.

Company /Dvc/tk/@/i

PVebtle Sclooel

Address DEgice: &) preeccmand & Logeilive, 1321

. e Do
Second R 5o

Phone 313 - 8 13- 6029

Contact name _™Mux. Brnn Masls Ko gpenorics

Ao

Company (Legal Registration)

A eRichpN EuBROIDE Ry dwe .

Address A\ 60, Py yMOULTH KOH'D L ivowies Mr-4g150
City — LivowiA State _MI 7Zip AR50
Telephone _ 134 -421- 9292 Fax  734-4 24 —05045

ML

Representative's Name (please print)

SQN'D&E_? Nm&ﬁ A q

Representative’s Tifle

?Rggibgr\w

Representative’s Signature

o

E-mail

Somnelea p @ aag 4gw/f

e [W»,[ﬁf f.0 oo et eves- uﬂ—ﬂ;

03/08/ 13

Date
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