
CITY of NOVI CITY COUNCIL 

Agenda Item 6 
August 12, 2019 

SUBJECT: Consideration of approval of the final payment to Sole Building Company for the 
ITC Storage Facility Construction Project in the amount of $135,396.50, plus interest earned on 
retainage.  

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Integrated Solutions – Facilities Management 

CITY MANAGER APPROVAL:   
EXPENDITURE REQUIRED $ 135,396.50 
AMOUNT BUDGETED $ 500,041 FY 2018-19 Budget 
APPROPRIATION REQUIRED $ 0 
LINE ITEM NUMBER 101-265.10-976.103

 BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 

The City sought out to build a storage facility at ITC Community Sports Park with the 
purpose of utilizing both equipment and staff resources more efficiently. While making 
Parks and Municipal Grounds Management much more efficient, this building is also able 
to provide storage for the Novi Youth Baseball League (NYBL) and serve as a trailhead 
with restrooms for the new ITC Trail. The Facilities Management Team was able to 
collaborate with NSA Architects and members of both the PRCS and Community 
Development staffs to develop a building that would achieve all of these goals. 
Sustainable options were also incorporated into the building including twenty-eight solar 
panels.  

The construction contract was awarded for this project at the May 21, 2018 City Council 
meeting to Sole Building Company, in the amount of $454,659. Facilities Staff worked with 
NSA Architects to review and verify the final contract payment amount of $135,396.50 
(attached Pay Application Number 4). 

 RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

Approval of the final payment to Sole Building Company for the ITC Storage Facility 
Construction Project in the amount of $135,396.50, plus interest earned on retainage. 



Sole' 5940 Commerce Dr., Westland, Ml 48185 (734) 326-5455 

APPLICATION AND CERTIFICATE FOR PAYMENT 
TO: OWNER: 
City of Novi 

PROJECT: 
Novi ITC Community Sport Park 
Storage Building 

CONTRACTOR'S APPLICATION FOR PAYMENT 

I CHANGE ORDER SUMMERY 
CHANGE ORDERS APPROVED ADDITIONS DEDUCTIONS 
IN PREVIOUS MONTHS BY 
OWNER TOTAL 

!APPROVED THIS MONTH: 

I NUMBER DATE APP: 

1 10324.70 

TOTALS 10324.70 0.00 
NET CHANGE BY CHANGE ORDERS 10324.70 

The undersigned Contractor certifies that to the best of the Contractor's 
knowledge, information and belief the Worll covered by this application 
for Payment has been completed in accordance with the Contract 
Documents, that all amounts have been paid by the Contractor for Work 
for which previous Certificates for Payment were issued and payments 
received from the Owner, and that current payment shown herein 
is now due. 

Date: z;;d9 

ARCHITECTS CERTIFICA" 
In accordance with the Contract Documents, based on on-site observations 
and the data comprising the above application. the Architect certifies to the 
Owner that to the best of the Architect's knowledge, information and 
berief, the Work has pogressed as indicated, the quality of the WOik is In 
accordance with the Contract Documents, and the Contractor is entitled to 
payment of the AMOUNT CERTIFIED. 

APPLICATION NO. 4 DISTRIBUTION TO: ( ) OWNER 
( ) ARCHITECT 

PERIOD FROM: ( ) CONTRACTOR 

PERTIOD TO: 

CONTRACT DATE: 
Application is made for Payments. as shown below, in connection with the Contract 

CONTINUATION SHEET, AIA DOCUMENT G703, is attached. 

The present status of the account for this Contract is as foUows: 

1. ORIGINAL CONTRACT SUM 

2. NET CHANGE BY CHANGE ORDERS 

3. CONTRACT SUM TO DATE (LINE 1 + 2) 

4. TOTAL COMPLETED & STORED TO DATE 

5 RETAINAGE. ____ % 

6. TOTAL EARNED LESS RETAINAGE 

7. LESS PREVIOUS CERTIFICATES FOR PAYMENT 

8. CURRENT PAYMENT DUE 

9. BALANCE TO FINISH, PLUS RETAINAGE 

State ot MICHIGAN 

$454,659.00 

$10,324.70 

$464,983.70 

$464,983.70 

$0.00 

$464,983.70 

32 9,587.20 

135,396.50 

0.00 

dllNF. A KAPALA 
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Bennett, Shannon

From: Joe Rossi <solebuildingcompany@comcast.net>
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 3:58 PM
To: Bennett, Shannon
Subject: RE: Sole Final Pay Dates

Good afternoon Shannon, 
The time period for the last billing was 12‐13‐18     6‐19‐19. 
Thank you for your patience! 
 
Giuseppe(Joe)Rossi 
Sole' Building Company 
C. 734.347.5052 
F. 734.326.5810 
 
 

 
 

From: Bennett, Shannon [mailto:sbennett@cityofnovi.org]  
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 8:34 AM 
To: Joe Rossi <solebuildingcompany@comcast.net> 
Subject: RE: Sole Final Pay Dates 
 
Joe, did you get a chance to look into those dates?  
 

From: Joe Rossi <solebuildingcompany@comcast.net>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 4:52 PM 
To: Bennett, Shannon <sbennett@cityofnovi.org> 
Subject: RE: Sole Final Pay Dates 
 
Thank you Shannon!!! 
 
Giuseppe(Joe)Rossi 
Sole' Building Company 
C. 734.347.5052 
F. 734.326.5810 
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